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THE FATE OF MONTE CRISTO

Edmond Dantes was a young sailor who, in 1815, returned to Marseilles with great expectations.

But Dantes' enemies had him imprisoned in the dungeons of Château D'If.

In prison, Dantes met and befriended an Italian abbé who educated him and then, in death, helped him escape
with a fabulous secret of a treasure on the island of Monte Cristo.

Rich and posing as the Count of Monte Cristo, Dantes returned with a beautiful companion named Haidee.

Dantes worked hard to ruin of the men who imprisoned him those many years are coming to fruition.

Danglars, his former shipmate. Fernand who stole Mercedes from him. Villefort, who signed the order for
his imprisonment.

After his revenge, the Count of Monte Cristo married Haidee and fathered a son named Spero.

But will the past catch up with Dantes in the form of the evil bandit Benedetto, who has started to wreak
havoc?

Will Dantes lose all that he truly loves?
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From reader reviews:

Janet Magnuson:

With other case, little men and women like to read book The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II). You
can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a
new book The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II). You can add expertise and of course you can around
the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From
your country until finally foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing it
is possible to know that. In this era, we can open a book or even searching by internet unit. It is called e-
book. You can use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's examine.

Mary Nixon:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what you problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They must answer that question since
just their can do that will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on guardería until university need this The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II) to read.

Deborah Knight:

This The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II) book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it the
world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is information inside this guide incredible
fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This kind of
The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II) without we know teach the one who studying it become critical
in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be worry The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II) can bring any
time you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in your
lovely laptop even telephone. This The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II) having good arrangement in
word and layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Edmund Morrissette:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of several books in the top
listing in your reading list is actually The Son of Monte Cristo, Volume II (of II). This book that is qualified
as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking way up and review
this e-book you can get many advantages.
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