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Since the days of Benjamin Rush, international medical graduates have made an important contribution to
American psychiatry as teachers, researchers, and clinicians. However, they routinely face a number of
obstacles throughout their careers, including discriminatory licensing requirements, few opportunities to
enter good training programs, and inequitable representation in professional societies. Although some
excellent scholarly books devoted to psychiatric training in psychiatry exist, most do not mention the specific
issues encountered in the training of international medical graduates.Written and edited by psychiatrists who
are international medical graduates themselves, "International Medical Graduates in Psychiatry in the United
States: Challenges and Opportunities" presents an overview of important issues pertinent to the career
development and training of this group and makes important suggestions for removing the obstacles they
face. This text will be useful to international medical graduates, residency training directors, and hospital
administrators. The book is divided into three subject areas. The first section discusses general adjustment
issues, including the difficulties encountered during the process of integration into American society,
communication and language problems, and immigration requirements. The second section focuses on
training issues and outlines the myths surrounding the postgraduate education of international medical
graduates, the sometimes difficult relationship between the ABPN and international medical graduates, and
the future of psychiatrists and their relationship to international medical graduates. The third section reviews
careerplanning, including advice on careers in academic and administrative psychiatry, a discussion on how
to start a private practice, and an exploration of the relationship among international medical graduates, the
American Psychiatric Association, other minorities, and organized medicine.
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From reader reviews:

Andrew Wilson:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic in the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill
your cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If
you want to try out look for book, may be the book untitled International Medical Graduates in the United
States: Challenges and Opportunities (Issues in Psychiatry) can be very good book to read. May be it can be
best activity to you.

Vickie Hintz:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love International Medical Graduates in the United
States: Challenges and Opportunities (Issues in Psychiatry), you may enjoy both. It is great combination
right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout people. What?
Still don't get it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Evelyn Montgomery:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will
make you to definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, magazine,
book, and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the
book that recommended for you is International Medical Graduates in the United States: Challenges and
Opportunities (Issues in Psychiatry) this reserve consist a lot of the information on the condition of this
world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer
require to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this book.
This is why this book appropriate all of you.

Alberta Keyes:

You may get this International Medical Graduates in the United States: Challenges and Opportunities (Issues
in Psychiatry) by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve
issue if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by simply written
or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you
just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own



personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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