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Robert Alter’s award-winning translation of the Hebrew Bible continues with the stirring narrative of
Israel’s ancient history.

To read the books of the Former Prophets in this riveting Robert Alter translation is to discover an
entertaining amalgam of hair-raising action and high literary achievement. Samson, the vigilante superhero
of Judges, slaughters thousands of Philistines with the jawbone of a donkey. David, the Machiavellian prince
of Samuel and Kings, is one of the great literary figures of antiquity. A ruthless monarch, David embodies a
life in full dimension as it moves from brilliant youth through vigorous prime to failing old age.

Samson and David play emblematic roles in the rise and fall of ancient Israel, a nation beset by internal
divisions and external threats. A scattering of contentious desert tribes joined by faith in a special covenant
with God, Israel emerges through the bloody massacres of Canaanite populations recounted in Joshua and
the anarchic violence of Judges. The resourceful David consolidates national power, but it is power rooted in
conspiracy, and David dies bitterly isolated in his court, surrounded by enemies. His successor, Solomon,
maintains national unity through his legendary wisdom, wealth, and grand public vision, but after his death
Israel succumbs to internal discord and foreign conquest. Near its end, the saga of ancient Israel returns to
the supernatural. In Elijah’s fiery ascent to heaven many would find the harbinger of a messiah coming to
save his people in their time of need.
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From reader reviews:

Melvin Loch:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive at this
point, people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded
place and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that
for a while is reading. Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay
than other is high. For yourself who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Ancient Israel:
The Former Prophets: Joshua, Judges, Samuel, and Kings: A Translation with Commentary book as basic
and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Brandon Inouye:

Do you among people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This Ancient Israel: The Former Prophets: Joshua, Judges, Samuel, and Kings:
A Translation with Commentary book is readable by means of you who hate the perfect word style. You will
find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving actually decrease
the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer connected with Ancient Israel: The Former Prophets:
Joshua, Judges, Samuel, and Kings: A Translation with Commentary content conveys objective easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just
different such as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Ancient Israel: The Former Prophets: Joshua, Judges,
Samuel, and Kings: A Translation with Commentary is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Jennifer Trojanowski:

You may spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Ancient Israel: The Former
Prophets: Joshua, Judges, Samuel, and Kings: A Translation with Commentary is simple to bring you can
read it in the area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the printed
book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the actual book in your
smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Richard Osteen:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Ancient Israel: The Former Prophets: Joshua,
Judges, Samuel, and Kings: A Translation with Commentary can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a
book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not
a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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