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This book, a continuation of the series “Advances in Materials Research,” is intended to provide the general
basis of the science and technology of crystal growth of silicon for solar cells. In the face of the destruction
of the global environment,the degradationofworld-widenaturalresourcesandtheexha- tion of energy sources
in the twenty-?rst century, we all have a sincere desire for a better/safer world in the future. In these days, we
strongly believe that it is important for us to rapidly developanewenvironment-
friendlycleanenergyconversionsystemusingsolar energyastheultimatenaturalenergysource.
Forinstance,mostofournatural resources and energy sources will be exhausted within the next 100 years.
Speci?cally, the consumption of oil, natural gas, and uranium is a serious problem. Solar energy is the only
ultimate natural energy source. Although 30% of total solar energy is re?ected at the earth’s surface, 70% of
total solar energy can be available for us to utilize. The available solar energy amounts to severalthousand
times larger than the world’s energy consumption in 2000 of about 9,000 Mtoe (M ton oil equivalent). To
manage 10% of the world’s energy consumption at 2050 by solar energy, we must manufacture 40 GW solar
cells per year continuously for 40 years. The required silicon feedstock is about 400,000 ton per year. We
believe that this is an attainable target, since it can be realized by increasing the world production of silicon
feedstock by 12times asmuchasthe presentproductionat2005.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Partee:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming
to you is you don't know which you should start with. This Crystal Growth of Silicon for Solar Cells
(Advances in Materials Research) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since
this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Timothy McKinney:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Crystal Growth of Silicon for Solar Cells
(Advances in Materials Research) guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make
book that could be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written in good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still doubt Crystal Growth
of Silicon for Solar Cells (Advances in Materials Research) as good book not just by the cover but also
through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't judge book by its include, so do you still needing
one more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why
you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Henry Hedrick:

On this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you are related is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of books in the top
record in your reading list is Crystal Growth of Silicon for Solar Cells (Advances in Materials Research).
This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning into precious person.
By looking upward and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Lisa Keener:

You can find this Crystal Growth of Silicon for Solar Cells (Advances in Materials Research) by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for
the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only simply by written or printed but also can you
enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking because of your mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about
your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date.
Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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