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In Giant Country Don Graham brings together a collection of lively, absorbing essays written over the past
two decades.

The collection begins with a twist on book introductions that sets the tone for the essays to come—a self-
interview conducted poolside at an eccentric Houston motel favored by regional rock bands. Over piña
coladas the author works on his tan and discusses timeless Texas themes: the transition of the state from a
rural to an urban world, the sense of a vanishing era, and the way that artists in literature and film represent a
state both infectiously grand and too big for its britches.

In “Fildelphia Story,” Graham remembers his Ivy League professorial stint in a city the small-town Texan
who rented him a moving van looked up under “F.” In “Doing England” the Lone Star Yankee courts Oxford
University and returns with a veddy British education. In “The Ground Sense Necessary” a native son
journeys inward to explore the dry ceremonies of frontier Protestantism and to recount movingly his father's
funeral in Collin County.

With his wide-ranging knowledge of classic regional works, Graham unerringly traces the style and
substance of local literary giants and offers a sometimes irreverent but always entertaining look at the Texas
triumvirate of Dobie, Webb and Bedichek. Other essays look at such Texas greats as Katherine Anne Porter,
George Sessions Perry, William Humphrey and John Graves.

In a section he calls “Polemics,” Graham includes his best known essays, “Palefaces vs. Redskins,” a
sardonic survey of the Texas literary landscape, and “Anything for Larry,” a tour de force that has already
become a minor classic. The essay weighs the puny financial achievements of Graham against those of
mega-author Larry McMurtry and never fails to bring down the house when Graham gives a public reading.

A recognized authority on celluloid Texas, Graham provides a rich sampling of his knowledge of Texas
movies in pieces that blanket the territory from moo-cow cattle-drive epics to soggy Alamo sagas to urban
cowboy melodramas.

In the larger-than-life state that is Texas, nobody sizes up the Lone-Star mythos, its interpreters, boosters and
detractors better than Don Graham.
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From reader reviews:

Royce Axtell:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or info even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and progress. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Giant Country: Essays
on Texas is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you
want and want in this era.

Robert Reynolds:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find publication that need more
time to be read. Giant Country: Essays on Texas can be your answer because it can be read by you actually
who have those short time problems.

Louis Ono:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When
you read a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what
types of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon.
The Giant Country: Essays on Texas will give you a new experience in examining a book.

Jose Roberts:

Beside that Giant Country: Essays on Texas in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh through the oven so don't
become worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Giant Country:
Essays on Texas because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you occasionally have
book but you rarely get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this with your
hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. So do
you still want to miss the idea? Find this book along with read it from now!
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